
Lots of people are fed up with the 
archetypal symbols of good taste that 
make so many boardrooms and confer-
ence spaces look identical. 

New functional features are also 
required for those higher up in hierar-
chies to keep body and mind on the ball 
in agile working environments and meet-
ings. Which is why the new Intra confer-
ence chair comes with a precision-ad-
justable height and a motion-stimulating 
synchronous adjustment mechanism 
with automatic weight adjustment. 

The synchro-adjustment mechanism and 
controls fuse almost invisibly with the 
similar form of the seat shell and the ele-
gantly integrated armrests. Intra’s fluid 
lines, the precise way the high-quality 
materials are combined and its dynamic 
comfort make it the new frontrunner for 
today’s executives – whether it’s in a 
conference room or an office.  

Intra
Design: Phoenix Design

Model 295/7

Intra. 
295 range

Model 295/6
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� Further information at: www.wilkhahn.com

Product safety and sustainability: certificates, standards, memberships. Visit the Wilkhahn website for more information.

Standard height backrest
295/6

Medium-height backrest
295/7
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Upholstery material

Bright chrome-plated aluminium or matt polished, coated in black or signal white

Frame surfaces

The digital sample colours differ from the originals. 


